
SETH SLAGLE  
AUCTIONEER
330.418.0267
sslagle@kikocompany.com

ONLINE ONLY AUCTION
Preview: Tuesday, October 21, 2025, 10:00 AM-1:00 PM

Pickup: Friday, October 24, 2025, 10:00 AM-3:00 PM

Walk-In Coolers/Restaurant Equipment/Booths. 
Bizerba Q-22 slicer; Nu-Vu model SUB123 oven; (2) 
Norlake walk-in coolers 4ft x 6ft; Norlake walk-in 
freezer 4ft x 6ft; stainless steel prep table; wire frame 
shelving; baking pans; steam table pans; single and 
triple basin sinks; Duke snack counters; belt dividers; 
Subway chip rack and shelf; Duke sink counter unit; 
stainless steel double door bread cabinet; trash bins; 
booths; high top tables and chairs; Duke 4-door soda 
counter; Turbochef toasting oven; many items not 
listed, please see catalog for full listing of items when 
posted.  

Auctioneer’s Note: 
Contact Seth Slagle at sslagle@kikocompany.com with 
any questions on how to buy. Buyers are encouraged 
to view items at our scheduled preview date on 
Tuesday, October 21, 2025, 10:00 AM-1:00 PM for 
further inspection. Click the “Register To Bid” button 
to view the full listing of items when the catalog 
is posted. If you have quality items you would like 
sold, contact Seth for your options. Pickup is Friday, 
October 24, 2025, 10:00 AM-3:00 PM. All items must 
be removed on designated pickup date due to the 
closing of this Subway location. No exceptions or 
additional days given.

Online Terms: 
Visa, MasterCard & Wire Transfer accepted. Wire 
Transfer required on purchases totaling $2,000 or 
greater. KIKO will not take personal checks or accept 
payment of more than $2,000 on a credit card. 15% 
buyer’s premium on all sales. Information is believed 
to be accurate but not guaranteed. Multi Par auction 
process may be used. 

Absolute Auction.
All sells to the 
highest bidders 
online only.

Scan for auction 
details, including 
directions.

www.kikoauctions.com | 800.533.5456

Information is believed to be 
accurate but not guaranteed.  

KIKO Auctioneers

AUCTION
STARTS: TUESDAY, OCTOBER 14, 2025, 10:00 AM
ENDS: TUESDAY, OCTOBER 21, 2025, 6:00 PM

ABSOLUTE

C&I EQUIPMENT

BIZERBA SLICER, 
WALK-IN COOLERS, 

RESTAURANT 
EQUIPMENT

222 E. SMOKERISE DR., 
WADSWORTH, OH 44281


